
  
  

Cod: 8587

Professional blender with 2-litre glass carafe

  

Description

Ristoattrezzature's professional blender with 2 litre glass carafe is the perfect equipment for
preparing smoothies and milkshakes. Compactness, safety and reliability make it a truly high-
performance product in the kitchen as well as at the bar. Ideal in every catering area: bars, ice
cream parlours, restaurants, kiosks, pubs and much more. The professional blender with 2 litre
glass jug is intended for the preparation of fresh smoothies but also juices, purees and sauces. A
professional piece of equipment that guarantees excellent performance at all times. Select your
customised product from the online catalogue. The professional blender with 2 litre bar tumbler
jug could be the perfect one for your professional needs. Design and operation The design of the
Ristoattrezzature professional blender with 2 litre glass carafe is characterised by its clean,
technical and intuitive lines. External dimensions 235x205x480 mm Weight 4 kg Voltage 230 V.
Try it even in small spaces and surprise your customers with sweet preparations quickly. The
blender is made entirely of stainless steel, has a jug made of the safest food-grade materials, and
its 2 litre capacity with the removable four-blade stainless steel knife inside ensures fast and
efficient blending. Non-slip handle and silicone feet are the perfect protection against overheating
and overloading. A safety microswitch on the lid and a cap allow you to add ingredients at every
stage of the process. A speed regulator and the motor's noise-reducing design ensure convenient



use at all times. Optimise your bar preparation time with the practical professional blender with 2
litre glass jug for bars and ice cream parlours. Versatile and reliable. Cleaning and maintenance
The easy cleaning of the professional blender with 2 litre glass j ug will allow you to enjoy the
appliance always in optimal conditions. The advice is to perform these operations daily and after
each use. The jug is designed for easy removal: it can be removed from the bottom of the blender
by simply lifting it gently. Choose gentle products and avoid using harsh detergents or abrasive
sponges. You could remove the chrome or scratch your appliance. Ensure your professional
kitchen is clean and hygienic in just a few steps. Why it's the right product for you Choose
Ristoattrezzature's professional blender with 2 litre glass jug for the preparation of your smoothies
and you'll rely on a product: Professional: for all areas of catering. Fast Powerful (1.6 kW) Easy to
use Safe: insulated handle and non-slip rubber feet. Durable. Excellent value for money.
Complete your work area in a professional way and discover all the details of the professional
blender chopper with 2 litre glass carafe on our website.

  

Dimensions

Dimensioni esterne 235x205x480 mm

Technical data

Capacità 2 Lt

Peso 4 kg

Potenza Elettrica 1.6 kW

Voltaggio 230 V
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